BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE (WAITING & LOADING/UNLOADING
RESTRICTIONS AND PARKING PLACES) CONSOLIDATION ORDER
2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No. 7 2010

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of their powers under Sections 1, 2, 3, 4,
i9, 32, 35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, &3, 63A, 66, | 17 and 124
(1) (¢) & (d) to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 as amended and Part 6 of the

Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all ather enabling powers hereby make the

above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the #' day of November
2010 and amends the Brighton & Hove (Waiting & Loading/Unioading Restrictions
and Parking Places) Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:-

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:
PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |
Part 2 No Loading/Unloading

After existing Part 2.8 add new Parts to the Index as follows:
2.9 | Monday to Friday 8am to 9.30am and 2pm to 4pm

2.10 | Monday to Friday 8.30am to 9.30am and 2pm to 4pm

Part4 No Stopping Restrictions
After existing Part 4.1 add a new Part to the Index as follows:

l 4.2 | Monday to Friday 7.30am - 9am and 3pm — é6pm I

Part 8 Doctors Parking Places
After existing Part 8.1 add a new Part to the Index as follows:

l 8.2 | 8am to 8pm on any day |

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Amend item 28 Albion Hill: delete “to a point 3.5 metres north of that kerbline”
and substitute “northwards for a distance of || metres”

Amend ltem 30 Albion Hill: delete 23 metres” and substitute “27.2 metres”, delete
"4 metres” and substicute “10.5 metres”

Amend ltem 3| Albion Hill: delete “to a point 21 metres north of that kerbline” and
substitute “northwards for a distance of 23.5 metras”

Add new Item |06a: Balsdean Road — South side — From the eastarn kerbline of
Newells Close eastwards for a distance of 10 metres



Add new ltem |06b: Balsdean Road — South side — From the western kerbline of
Newells Close westwards for a’ distance of 5 metres

Amend ltem 118 Barrhill Avenue: insert “a point [0.6 metres south of ' between

“Fram" and “the northern boundary”, delete 34 metres” and substitute "62.2
metres”

Amend ltem |19 Barrhill Avenue: insert 8.3 metres south of a point” between
“point” and "opposite the northern boundary”, delete “29 metres” and substitute
“52.3 metres”

Amend ltem 226 Boundary Road, Hove: delete *[6.8 metres” and substitute “13.5
metres”

Amend ltem 227 Boundary Road, Hove: delete “95 metres” and substitute “15.8
metres

Add new ltem 228a Boundary Poad, Hove — East side ~ From the northern kkerbline
of Portland Road northwards to the level crossing

Add new ltem 229a Boundary Road, Hove — East side — From a paint 72.8 metres
south of the southern kerbline of Portland Road southwards for a distance of 8.6
metres

Amend Item 230 Boundary Road, Hove: delete existing description and substitute
“From a point 120.7 metres north of the northern kerbline of New Chureh Road
northwards for a distance of |7 metres

Delete ltem 231; Boundary Road, Hove

Add new Item 231: Boundary Road, Hove — East side — From the northern kerbline
of New Church Road northwards for a distance of 50.5 metres

Delete ltem 232: Boundary Road, Hove

Add new ltem 232: Boundary Road, Hove — East side ~ From the southern kerbline
of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 7.2 metres

Delete ltem 233: Boundary Road, Hove

Add new Item 233: Boundary Road, Hove — East side — From a point 36.2 metres
south of the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of
1.7 metres

Delete Item 234: Boundary Road, Hove

Delete Item 235: Boundary Road, Hove

Amend ltem 236 Boundary Road, Hove: delete “southwards to a point 15 metres”
and substitute “‘southwards to a point [4.6 metres”



Amend ftem 237 Boundary Road, Hove: delete “45 metres™ and substitute “35.2
metres’”

Amend ltem 330 Carlton Tel__'race, Portslade: delete “the back of ", delete “55
metres” and substitute ‘6.8 metres”

Amend ltem 331 Carlton Terrace, Portslade: delete “56 metres” and substitute "9
metres”

Amend ltem 336 Chailey Avenue: delete “both sides’ and substitute “East side”

Add new ltem 336¢: Chailey Avenue — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Marine Drive northwards for a distance of 30 metres

Delete Item 402: Clermont Road

Delete ltem 444d: County Qak Avenue — South west side ~ From the northern
kerbline of Denton Drive north westwards for a distance of 17.5 metres

Delete [tem 444e: County Oak Avenue - South west side — From the southern
pavement of Denton Drive south westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new lcem 465a: Crespin Way — East side — From the proiongatibn of the
northern kerbline of Barrow Hill northwards to the turning area opposite No.67
Crespin Way

Amend ltem 53| Davey Drive: delete existing description and substitute “From the
eastern kerbline of Southmount eastwards for a distance of 10 metres”

Add new ltem 53[a: Davey Drive: South side — From the western kerbline of
Southmount westwards for a distance of |} metres

Delete ltem 549: Denton Drive

Delete ltem 616: Down Terrace

Amend ltem 638 Dyke Road: delete "and from the southern kerbline of Hove Park
Road south for |0 metres”

Add new ltem 63Ba: Dyke Road — West side — From the southern kerbline of Hove
Park Road southwards for a distance of 14 metres

t

Amend ltem 642 Dyke Road: delete “23.5 metres” and substitute "16 metres’

Add new ltem 645a: Dyke Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Woodruff Avenue northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new ltem 645b: Dyke Road — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Woodruff Avenue southwards for a distance of 10 metres



Add new ltem 703a: Eastwick Close — Both sides — Whaole Length
Amend item 785 Elrington Road: delete “both sides” and substitute “west side”
Amend ltem 786 Erlington Road: delete “both sides” and substitute “west side”

Add new ltem 786a: Elrington Road — East side — From the southern kerbline of The
Droveway southwards to the northern kerbline of Hove Park Road

Amend ltem 789a Elsted Crescent: delete “a point 34 metres east and south of " and
insert “eastwards then' between “Bramble Way” and “southwards”, delete “25
metres” and substitute “59 metres”

Amend item 789b Flsted Crescent: delete “26 metres east and south” and substitute
“7 metres east”, insert “eastwards then" between “Bramble Way" and
“southwards”, delete 25 metres” and substitute “44 metres”

Amend ltem 794 Erroll Road: delete “Both side” and substitute “East side”

Add new ltemn 794a: Erroll Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Kingsway northwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new ltem 823d: Farm Hill = North side — From the eastern kerbline of Farm Hill
eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new ltern 823e; Farm Hill — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Farm Hill
eastwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new item B23f Farm Hill — East side — From the southern kerbline of Farm Hill
southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new Item 823g: Farm Hill - East side — From the northern kerbline of Farm Hill
northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add Item 837a: Florence Place — South and east side — From a point 51.8 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Ditchling Road eastwards then northwards for a
distance of 8.9 metres

Amend ltem 843 Foredown Road: delete “and south”, delete “35 metres” and
substitute " 14 metres”

Add new ltem 855a: Founthill Road — South side — From a point 2.2 metres east of
the western boundary wall of No. 5 Founthill Road eastwards for a distance of 10
metres

Add new ltem 855b: Founthill Road — North side — From the western kerbline of
Westmeston Avenue westwards for a distance of |5 metres

Add new ltem 874a; Fox Way — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Harebell
Drive eastwards for a distance of 10 metres



Add new Item 874b: Fox Way — South side — From the western kerbline of Harebell
Drive westwards for a distance of |0 metres

Delete item 895: Freshfield Road

Add new Item 1022a: Graham Close, Portslade — West side — From the southern
boundary wall of No. 33 Graham Close southwards for a distance of 12.5 metres

Add new ltem 1146a: Hardwiclc Way — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Harmsworth Crescent northwards for a distance of |1 metres

Add new Item | 146b: Harebell Drive — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Fox WVay southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new ltem 1146¢c: Harebell Drive — East side — From the southern lkerbline of
Fox VWay southwards for a distance of |0 metres

Add new ltem | 147a: Harmsworth Crescent — North side — From the western
kerbline of Hardwick Way westwards for a distance of 20 metres

Amend ltem |385 Kingsway: delete "'14 metres” and substitute "6 metres”

Amend ltem 1386 Kingsway: delete 14 metres” and substicute "6 metres”

Amend lterm 1387 Kingsway: delete “14 metres” and substitute 6 metres”

Amend ltem 1388 Kingsway: delete *17.5 metres” and substitute "6 metres”

Amend Item 1389 Kingsway: delete "14 metres” and substitute “6 metres”

Amend ltem 1451 Leybourne Road: delete “|0 metres” and substitute *14.5 metres”

Add new ltem |616a: Marlow Road — North side — From the western lkerbline of
Wilson Avenue westwards for a distance of B metres '

Add new ltem 1616b: Marlow Road — South side ~ From the western kerbline of
Wilson Avenue westwards for a distance of B metres

Amend ltem 1681 Mile Oal Road: delete *10 metres” and substitute “14.5 metras”

Add new ltem 1694a: Millcross Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of
Foredown Road eastwards for a distance of 23.5 metres.

Add new Item 1830a: Newells Close — East side — From the southern kerbline of
Balsdean Road southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new ltem 1830b: Newells Close — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Balsdean Road southwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new ltem 2276a: St Andrew's Road, Portslade — South side — From the western
boundary wall of No.67c St Andrew’s Road westwards for a distance of 5 metres



Add new ltem 2276b: St Andrew's Road, Portslade — South side — From the western
boundary wall of No.65 St Andrew’'s Road westwards for a distance of 6 metres

Amend ltem 2291 St Leonard’s Avenue: delete 14 metres” and substitute "6
metres”

Amend ltem 2308 St Leonard's Road: delete *|4 metres” and substitute "6 metres”
Amend item 2366 Seaford Road: delete 6 metres” and substitute 8.3 metres”

Add new ltem 2393a; Shelldale Avenue — North side — From the eastern kerbline of
Shelldale Crescent eastwards for a distance of 7 metres

Add new Itemn 2395a: Shelldale Crescent — East side — From the northern kerbline of
Shelldale Avenue northwards for a distance of 7 metres

Add new ltem 2395b: Shelldale Crescent — West side — From the northern kerbline
of Shelldale Crescent northwards for a distance of 8.5 metres

Add new Item 2395c: Shelidale Crescent — North side — From the western kerbline
of Shelldale Crescent westwards for a distance of B metres

Add new Item 243%a: Sidehill Drive — West & North sides — From a point 21.4
metres west then north of the western boundary wall of Nos. 31/33 Sidehill Drive
northwards then eastwards for a distance of 8 metres

Amend ltem 2465 Southmount: delete “kerbline of Southmount™ and substitute “for
a distance of |10 metres”

Amend ftem 2544: Station Road, Portslade: delete “Both” (Side) and substitute
“East”, delete “From the boundary between the properties” and substitute “From a
point opposite the boundary”

Delete ltem 2547: Station Road, Portstade

Add new item 2547: Station Road, Portslade — West side — From a point 68.6
metres south of the southern kerbline of Vale Road southwards for a distance of 7.7
metres

Delete Item?2548; Station Road, Portsiade

Add new ltem 2548: Station Road, Portslade — West side — From the northern
kerbline of Franklin Road northwards for a distance of 39.] metres

Add new ltem 2548a: Station Road, Portslade — West side — From the southern
lkerbline of Franklin Road southwards for a distance of 19.3 metres

Add new |tem 2548b: Station Road, Portslade — West side — From the northern
lerbline of St Aubyn’s Road northwards for a distance of 15.4 metres



Add new |tem 2548c: Station Road, Portslade — West sidle — From the southern
kerbline of St Aubyn's Road southwards for a distance of 6.9 matres

Amend ltem 2549 Station Road, Portslade: delete “From a point 15 metres” and
substitute “From a point 2.6 metres”, delete “south to a point |5 metres” and
substitute “south to a point 5.7 metres”

Amend ltem 2550 Station Road, Portslade: delete “From a point |5 metres” and
substitute “From a point 15.7 metres”, delete “southward to a point |5 metres” and

substitute “southwards to a point 15.7 metres”

Amend ltem 2551 Station Road, Portslade: delete "30 metres” and substitute “44.8
metres”

Add new ltem 2620a: Taunton Road — East side — From a point 150 metres south
west of the western kerbline of Taunton Way southwards for a distance of 4

metres

Add new Item 2719a: The Rotyngs — South side — From the western kerbline of
Falmer Road westwards for a distance of 13.7 metres

Add new ltem 2719b: The Rotyngs — North side — From the western kerbline of
Falmer Road westwards for a distance of |7 metres

Amend Item 2806 Upper Hollingdean Road: delete existing side of road and
description and substitute “East side — From the north kerbline of Davey Drive

northwards for a distance of 28 metres”

Add new Item 2806a; Upper Hollingdean Road — East side — From the southern
kerbline of Davey Drive southwards for a distance of 36.5 metres

Add new Item 2812a: Upper Hollingdean Road — East side — From a point 47.5
metres south of the southern kerbline of Davey Drive southwards for a distance of

30.2 metres

Add new ltem 2942a: Wayfield Avenue — South side — From a point 43.5 metres
west of the western kerbiine of Holmes Avenue westwards for a distance of 17.4

metres

Amend ltem 2901 Walefield Road: delete existing side of road and description and
substitute “East side — From the northern kerbline of Upper Lewes Road
northwards for a distance of 32.3 metres”

Add new Item 2901a: Walcefield Road — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Upper Lewes Road northwards for a distance of 68 metres

Add new ltem 2979a: Westmeston Avenue- West side — From the northern kerbline
of Founthill Road northwards for a distance of [5 metres

Add new ltem 3017¢: Wilson Avenue — West side — From the northern kerbline of
Mariow Road northwards for a distance of 8.5 metres



Add new Item 3017d: Wilson Avenue — West side — From the southern kerbline of
Marlow Road southwards for a distance of 12.5 metres

Add new Item 3046c: Withdean Road - East side — From a point 4|.6 metres north
of the northern kerbline of Tivoli Crescent North northwards for a distance of 29

metres

Add new ltem 3091:; Woodruff Avenue — North side — From the western kerbline of
Dyke Road westwards for a distance of [0 metres

Add new ltem 3092: Woodruff Avenue — South side — From the western kerbline of
Dyke Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Part 1.2 No Waiting Monday to Sunday §.00am to 6pm
Delete item |: Portland Road

Delete ltem 2: Worcester Villas

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 8.00 arm to 6.00 pm
Amend |tem | Albion Street, Brighton: delete existing description and substitute
“From a point 33.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Richmond Parade
northwards for a distance of 22 metres”

Amend ltem 2 Albion Street, Brighton: delete existing description and substitute
“From a point 78 metres north of the northern kerbline of Richmond Parade
northwards for a distance of 18.5 metres”

Amend ltem 4 Albion Street, Brighton: delete existing description and substitute
“From a point 103.3 metres north of the northern kerbline of Richmond Read
northwards for a distance of 25.8 metres”

Delete [tem 5: Albion Street, Portslade

Delete [tem 6: Albion Street, Portslade

Delete Item 7 Albion Street, Portslade

Delete ltem 8: Boundary Road, Hove

Delete ltem 9: Boundary Road, Hove

Delete ltem | I: Boundary Road, Hove

Delete ltem |2: Boundary Road, Hove

Amend Item |4 Boundary Road, Hove: delete “62.5 metres™ and substitute “63.2
metres”, delete “1 | metres” and substitute "9.5 metres”

Delete [tem [6: Bramble Rise



Delete ltem |7: Bramble Rise

Amend ltem |8 Carlton Terrace: delete 10 metres™ and substitute "9 metres’,
delete “to a point 55 metres south of Old Shoreham Road” and substitute “for a
distance of 47.1 metres”

Amend ltem 19 Carlton Terrace: delete 28 metres” and substitute “77.1 metres’,
delete “to a point 92.7 metres south of Old Shoreham Road" and substitute “for a
distance of 122.5 metres”

Delete Itern 22: Copse Hill

Delete Item 23: County Oak Avenue

Delete |tem 24: Denmark Road, Portslade

Delete Item 25 Franklin Road, Portslade

Amend ltem 26 Gordon Road, Portslade: delete “15 metres” and substitute 422
metres”

Amend [tem 27 Gordon Road, Portslade: delete “15 metres” and substitute “{5.7
metres”

Delete ltem 28: Hangleton Way

Delete ltem 29: Hangleton VWay

Delete Item 30: Hanover Terrace
Delete Item 3|: Hanover Terrace
Delete Item 32: High Street, Rottingdean
Delete Item 34: Longridge Avenue
Delete ltem 35: Melbourne Street
Delete Item 36: Melbourne Street
Delete ltem 38: Natal Road

Amend ltem 39 Natal Road: delete “8 metres” and substitute "9 metres”, delete “37
metres” and substitute “36.5 metres”

Delete ltem 40: Nevill Road, Rottingdean
Delete ltem 41: Nevill Road, Rottingdean

Delete Item 42: Nevill Road, Rottingdean



Amend ltem 44 Newmarket Road: delete “22.5 metres” and substiture “23.5
meires”, delete " 14 metres” and substitute “1 1.5 metres”

Delete Item 45: Old Shoreham Road
Delete item 46: Old Shoreham Road
Amend ltem 47 Qlive Road: delete “both sides” and substitute “east side”

Add new ltem 47a: Olive Road — West side — From a point 15 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Florence Avenue northwards for a distance of 33 metres.

Amend ltem 48 Olive Road: delete **15 metres” and substitute “14.2 metres”
Delete Item 49: Olive Road

Delete ltem 50: Olive Road

Delete ltem 51: Olive Road

Delete ltem 52: Southdown Avenue

Delete Item 53: St Andrew's Road

Delete Item 54: St Andrew's Road

Delete ltem 55: St Michael's Road

Delete ltem 56: Station Road, Portisade

Add new ltem 56: Station Road, Porislade — West side — From a point 154 metres
north of the northern kerbline of St Aubyn’s Road northwards for a distance of 38.2
metres

Delete {tem 57: Station Road, Portslade

Delete item 59: Station Road, Portsiade

Add new ltem 59: Station Road, Portslade — West side — From a point 56.1 metres
north of the northern kerbline of Franklin Road northwards for a distance of 53.4

metres

Amend ltem 60 Steyning Road: delete “39.6 metres” and substitute “4| metres”,
delete “188.7 metres” and substitute *189.7 metres”

Delete Item 61: Trafalgar Road
Delete ltem 62: Upper Hollingdean Road

Amend Item 63 Upper Lewes Road: insert “15.7 metres” after “From a point”,
delete "94 metres” and substitute *93 metres”

10



Amend ltem 64 Upper Lewes Road: delete “113.5 metres” and substitute “H27
metres”, delete “60.5 metres” and substitute *55.5 metres”

Delete ltem 65: Vale Road, Portslade

Amend ltem 67 Victoria Road: delete “23 metres” and substitute *40.5 metres”,
delete 15 metres” and substitute “13.5 metres”

Amend Item 68 Victoria Road: delete “23 metres” and substitute 25 metres”

Amend ltem 69 Victoria Road: delete " 15 metres” and substitute “i6 metres”, delete
“50 metres” and substitute “49 metres”

Delete ltem 70: Victoria Road

Add new Item 70: Victoria Road — South side — From a point 1.3 metres west of the
eastern boundary wall of Portslade Town Hall westwards for a distance of 23.7
metres.

Delete ltem 71: Victoria Road

Delete Item 72: Victoria Road

Delete Item 73: Wayfield Avenue

Delete Item 74: Wayfield Avenue

Delete Item 75: Wellington Street

Delete Item 76: Woodside Avenue

Delete ltem 77: Warcester Villas

Amend ltem 78 Worcester Villas: delete *23 metres” and substitute “20.5 metres”,
delete “7 metres” and substitute *19 metres”

Delete ltem 79: Worcester Villas
Part 1.6 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9.00 am to 6.00 pm

Add new ltem 7a: Boundary Road, Hove — East side — From a point 135.8 metres
south of the southern kerbline of Hallyburton Road southwards for a distance of

42.1 metres
Add new Item 30: Southall Avenue — North west side — Whole Length

Part 1.9 No Waiting Monday to Friday 8am to 5pm
Renumbering existing ltem | Greyfriars as ltem 2

Add new item 1: Albion Street, Portslade — West side - From a point {5 metres
north of the northern kerbline of North Street northwards for 27 metres.

11



Add new item la: Albion Street, Portslade — East side - From a point 63 metres
south of the southern kerbline of St Andrew;s Road southwards for 10 metres.

Add new item |b: Albion Street, Portslade — East side - From a point 15 metres
north of the northern kerbline of North Street northwards for 7.5 metres.

Part 1.13 No Waiting Monday to Friday 9.00am to 6pm
Renumber existing ltem | Cromwell Street as ttem 2

Add new Item |: Clermont Road — South side — From its western end to a point
opposite the eastern kerbline of Station Road.

Delete ltem 2: Cromwell Street
Delete Item 3: Natal Road
Delete ltem 4: Southall Avenue
Delete ftem 5: Wyndham Street

Part 2.1 No Waiting or Loading at any time
Renumber existing ltem 8a Stanley Road as ltem 8b

Add new Item 8a; South Street — From a point 2 metres east of the eastern kerbline
of the access to Robins Row westwards then northwards for a distance of 26 metres

Part 2.8 No Loading/unloading Monday to Friday 8am to 9.30am and
2.30pm to 4pm

Delete Item 1: County Oalc Avenue

Delete Item 2: County Oak Avenue

Delete item 3: County Oak Avenue

Delete tem 4: Denton Drive

Delete Itemn 5: Denton Drive

After Part 2.8 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.9 No Loading/unloading Monday to Friday 8am to 9.30am and

2pm to 4pm
:if. Road Name | Side Description %thr
From a point |50 metres south west
| Taunton East | of the western kerbline of Taunton
Road side | Way southwards for a distance of |4
metres

12



After Part 2.9 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.10 No Loading/unloading Monday to Friday 8.30am to 9.30am and

Ipm to 4pm
Ref . e Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date
County Oal North From the southern kerbline of Carden
| ounty Loak Avenue south eastwards for a distance of 2010
Avenue east
180 metres
County Oak | South From the northern kerbline of Denton
p ty Drive north westwards for a distance of 2010
Avenue west
17.5 metres
County Oak | South From the southern lcerbline of Denton
3 7 Drive south westwards for a distance of 10 2010
Avenue west
metres
Dento From the south west kerbline of County
4 Drir\lJe n North | Oak Avenue westwards for a distance of 30 2010
metres
Denton From the south west kerbline of County
5 Drive South | Oak Avenue westwards for a distance of 30 2010
metres

Part 4.1 No Stopping on School Keep Clear Zig Zag Markings Monday to
Friday 8.30am - 9.30am and 2.00pm - 4.00 pm (except August)

Add new Item 6a: Barn Rise — West side — From a point 42 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Mill Rise northwards for a distance of 26 metres

Add new ltem 55a: Radinden Manor Road — South side — From a point 185.96
metres north of the northern kerbline of Old Shoreham Road northwards for a

distance of 25.56 metres

Delete ltem 62: The Droveway

After Part 4.1 insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 4.2
No Stopping on School Keep Clear Zig Zag Markings Monday to Friday

7.30am = 9am and 3

pm —~ 6pm (except August)

Zif. Road Name | Side Description %:::Zr
From a point 85.5 metres west of the
| The South | western kerbline of Dyke Road
Droveway side | westwards for a distance of 31.56

metres

Part 5.3 Limited waiting for 30 Minutes (no return within | hour) Monday

to Saturday 9am to épm
Amend Item 2 The Highway: delete 42 metres” and substitute “36.5 metres”

13




Part 5.9 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within | hour) Monday to
Sunday 8am to 8pm
Renumber existing [tem | Knoyle Road as ltem 2

Add new Item |: Amherst Crescent — East side - At 60 degrees to the kerb, from a
point 13.5 metres south of the southern kerbline of Amherst Crescent southwards
for a distance of 4.8 metres

Part 5.12 Limited waiting for 2 hours (no return within | hour) Monday
to Saturday 9am to 6pm

Amend ltem 4 Nevil! Road: delete " 14.5 metres’ and substitute *17.5 metres”,
delete “26.5 metres” and substitute “23.5 metres”

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Delete item |: Abinger Road, Portslade — YVest side — From a polnt 32.5 metres
north of the northern lerbline of Crown Road northwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.31)

Delete ltem 4: Albion Hill — West side from a point 20.5 metres south of the
prolongation of the southern kerbline of Albion Hill southwards for a distance of 5.5
metres

Renumbering existing item 6a Albion Street, Portslade as [tem &b

Add new Item 6a: Albion Street, Brighton — West side — From a point 20 metres
south of the prolongation of the southern kerbline of Albion Hill southwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres.

Delete Item 12 Arundel Street — East side — Extending from a point 128.5 metres
north of the northern kerbline of De Courcel Road northwards for a distance of 5.5
metres. (outside No.20)

Add new ltem 14a: Auckland Drive — North side — From a point 66 metres west of
the boundary wall between Nos.| 15 & 117 Auckland Drive northwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.103)

Add new Item 35d: Beatty Avenue — West side — From a point 20 metres north of
the northern kerblfine of Waldron Avenue northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(opposite Library)

Delete Itern 51a: Bishop Road — West side — From a point 53 metres north of the
northern kerbline of The Droveway northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.|2)

Add new ftem 54c : Bonchurch Road — East side — From a point 6.6 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Bernard Place northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.44)

Renumber existing ltem 54b: Braeside Avenue as Item 54c

14



Delete ltem 54c: Brading Road — East side — From a point 7 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Elm Grove northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (adjoining

No.169 Elm Grove)

Add new Item 79a: Church Street, Portslade — South side — From a point 8 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Church Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

(adjoining No.51 Church Road)

Add new ltem 87a: Coleman Street- West side — From a point 27 metres north of
the boundary wall between Nos. 23 & 24 Coleman Street northwards for a distance

of 5.5 metres (outside No.30)

Delete ltem 92: Copse Hill — South side — From a point [ 15 metres north of the
western lcerbline of Eldred Avenue northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside

No.27)

Add new Item 93a: Court Farm Road —South side — From a point 27 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Holmes Avenue eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (Near

to No.70)

Add new Itamn 99b: Crabtree Avenue — South side ~ from a point 26 metres east of
the boundary wall between Nos. 66 & 68 Crabtree Avenue eastwards for a distance

of 5.5 metres (opposite No.71)

Amend ltem 121 Davey Drive: delete "4 metres north of the™ and substitute "2
metres south of the”

Add new ltem 122¢: Dean Gardens — West side — From a point 17 metres north of
the boundary wall between Nos. 35 & 37 Dean Gardens northwards for a distance

of 5.5 metres (outside No.29)

Delete Item |96: Fairway Crescent — East side — From a point 5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Burlington Gardens northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

(outside No. 1}

Delete Item 198: Fallowfield Crescent — North side ~ From a point 125.5 metres
south west of the western kerbline of Fallowfield Close south westwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.40)

Delete ltem 215: Freshfield Road — North side - From a point 30 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of the western limb of Firle Road eastwards for 5.5 metres (outside

No.253)

Add new ltem 219¢: Gableson Avenue — West side — From a point 35 metres south
of the western kerbline of Valley Drive southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

(outside No.25)

Add new [tem 230: Godwin Road — East side — From a point 71.5 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Bellingham Crescent northwards for a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.10)

15



Delete Item 241: Gordon Road, Brightan — South side — From a point 87 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Surrenden Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5
metres

Add new ltem 249a: Graham Avenue, Portslade — North side — From a point 65
metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Stanley Avenue eastwards
for a distance of 5.5 metres (opposite No.42)

Delete ltem 269: Hardwick Road ~ East side — From a point 78 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Hangleton YWay southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside Nos., 110/112)

Delete ltem 284: Havelock Road ~ West side — From a point B5.5 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Prestan Drove southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.169)

Add new ltem 2B4a: Havelock Road — West side — From a point [07.5 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Lucerne Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.67)

Add new Item 284b: Havelock Road — West side - From a point |33 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Preston Drove southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.159}

Add new ltem 295b: Hertford Road — East side — From a point 119 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Hollingbury Place northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.6)

Delete item 302: Hodshrove Road — East side — From a point 109.5 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Moulsecoomb Way southwards from a distance of 5.5
metres (outside No.122)

Delete ltem 307b: Hollingbury Rise — South side — From a point 9.4 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Stanmer Villas eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres {outside
No.4)

Delete Item 329b; Hythe Road — South side — From a point 159 metres west of the
western lerbline of Ditchling Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside
No.80)

Delete Iten 331: Ingram Crescent East — East side ~ From a point 93.5 metres north
of the narthern kerbline of Portland Road northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Delete ltem 338a: Jersey Street — East side — From a point 9.8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Southover Street southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside Nos. 28/29)

Add new |tem 367a: Leicester Villas — West side — From a point 109 metres south of

the southern lkerbline of Portland Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.34)

16



Amend Item 378 Locks Crescent: delete “Locks Hill" and substitute “the access road
rear of No.55 Locks Crescent”

Add new ltem 378a: Locks Crescent — East side — From a point 59.5 metres south of
the western kerbline of the access road rear of No.55 Locks Crescent southwards
for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.47)

Delete |tem 388: Loder Road — North side — From a point 96 metres west of the
western kerbline of Balfour Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside

No.115)

Delete ltem 446: Montreal Road — Fast side — From a point 37 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Albion Hill northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres {outside

No.20)

Delete Item 452: Moulsecoomb Way — East side — From a point |60 metres south of
the southern lerbline of Halland Road south for 5.5 metres {outside No.1 10)

Delete |tem 455: Moulsecoomb Way — South side ~ From a point |33 metres south
of the prolongation of the southern kerbline of Stonecross Road southwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.66)

Add new ltem 487a: Oakdene Gardens - West side — From a point 35 metres south
of the southern kerbline of QOaldene Avenue southwards for a distance of 5.5

metres (outside No. 9}

Delete ltem 501: Park Crescent, Rottingdean — West side — Extending from a point
43 metres north of the northern kerbline of Park Road northwards for a distance of

5.5 metres (outside No.9)

Delete Item 502: Park Crescent, Rottingdean — West side — Extending from a point
7.5 metres south of the northern end southwards for a distance of 5 metres (outside

No.10)

Add new Item 569d: Sandown Road — West side — From a point 9 metres south of
the boundary wall between Nos. 41 & 43 Sandown Road southwards for a distance

of 5.5 metres (outside No.37)

Add new ltem 594 Singleton Road —~ South side ~ From a point 65 metres west of
the western kerbline of Portfield Avenue westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.8)

Add new ltem 6022: Southdown Road — West side — From a point 56 metres south
of the southern kerbline of North Lane southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

(outside No.[46)

Add new ltem 603A: Southover Street — West side — From a point 3 metres north
of the northern kerbline of Newark Place northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

(opposite No.24)

Add new ltem 608b: Springfield Road — South side — From a point 42 metres west of

17



the boundary wall between Nos. |10 & 112 Springfield Road westwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.94)

Add ltem 608c: Springfield Road — North side — From a point 84.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Southdown Avenue eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.99)

Add new ltem 612a: St Aubyn's Road — South side — From a point 60 metres west of
the western kerbline of Station Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.12)

Delete ltem 614: St Leonard's Avenue — West side — From a point 28 metres north
of the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.20)

Delete Item 640: Staplefield Drive — VWest side — From a point in line of the northern
boundary wall of No.125 northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.|27)

Delete ltem 644b: Stonecross Road — North side — From a point 90 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Shortgate Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.25)

Delete ltem 704: Walcefield Road — East side — From a point 77 metres south of the
prolongation of the southern kerbline of Princes Crescent southwards for a distance
of 5.5 metres (outside No.18)

Add new ltem 712: Warleigh Road — West side — From a point 47 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Clyde Road Southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
{outside No.31)

Add new ltemn 7 12b: Warrior Close - North side — From a point |3 metres east of
the boundary wall between Nos. 36 & 37 Warrior Close eastwards for a distance of
5.5 metres (outside No.39)

Delete ltem 716: Waverley Crescent ~ East side — From a point 18.5 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Thompson Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new ltem 760: Worcester Villas — West side — From a point 94.5 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Portand Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(outside No.40a})

Part 6.2 Disabled Parking Bay limited to 3 hours (no return within | hour)
Add new ltem 7a: The Highway — South west side - From a point 51.4 metres north
west of its junction with Southhall Avenue, north-westwards for a distance of 5.5
metres

Amend ltem 10 Whitehawlc Road: delete “Hanley Road™ and substitute “Henley
Road”

18



Part 7.1 Solo Motorcycles Parking Bay At Any Time
Add new ltem 3b: Nevill Road — South side — From a point 14.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of High Street, Rottingdean westwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part 8.1 Doctors Parking Place At Any Time

Amend ltem 1 Albion Street, Brighton: delete existing description and substitute
“From a point 55.5 metres north of the northern ikerbline of Richmond Parade
northwards for a distance of [ | metres”

Amend ltem 2 Hertford Road: delete “50 metres” and substitute "49.4 metres”
Amend ltem 3 Islingword Road: delete **19.5 metres” and substitute “22.6 metres”
Amend ltem 4 Longridge Avenue: delete *13.5 metres” and substitute “9.8 metres”]

‘Delete ltem 5: Wellington Read, Brighton

Afrer Part 8. insert a new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 8.2
Doactors Parking Place 8am — 8pm on any day
Ref . . Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date
Wellington From a point 16.9 metres north of
g west | the northern kerbline of ElIm Grove
i Road, , )
) side | northwards for a distance of 13.2
Brighton
metres

Part 9.1 Car Club Spaces At Any Time (City Car Club)
Renumber existing ltem |: Chester Terrace as ltem 2

Add new ltem |: Bernard Place — North side — From a point 6 metres west of the
wastern: kerbline of Brading Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Renumber existing Item 2: D'Aubigny Road as |tem 3
Renumber existing ltem 3: Holland Street as ltem 7
Renumber existing tem 4: Hollingdean Terrace as ltem 8

Add new ltem 4: Finsbury Road — East side - From a point |8 metres north of the
narthern kerbline of Southover Street northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Renumber existing ltem 5: Islingword Road as Item 9 and delete existing description
and substitute “North east side — From a point 8 metres south east of the north

west kerbline of Islingword Road for a distance of 5.5 metres”

Add new Item 5: Grove Street — West side — From a point 7 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Southover Street southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Delete leem 6: Jackson Street

19



Renumber existing ltem 7: Riley Road as Item |0
Renumber existing ltem 8: Sandgate Road as item ||
Renumber existing item 9: Springfield Road as Item 12
Renumber. existing ltem 10: Springfield Road as Item 13
Renumber existing Item | 1: Warleigh Road as ltem |4
Renumber existing [tem 12: Whichelo Place as ltem |3
Renumber existing ltem 13: Windmill Street as ltem 16
Renumber existing ltem 14: Worcester Villas as item 17

Part 9.2 Car Club Spaces At Any Time (Whizzgo)
Delete ltem 2 : Finsbury Road

Part 9.3 Car Club Spaces At Any Time (Streetcar)
Renumber existing [tem |: Ewart Street as ltem 3

Add new ltem |: Bernard Place — South side — From a point 6 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Bernard Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new Item 2: Bonchurch Road - West side —~ From a point 10 metres north of
the northern lcerbline of Elm Grove northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new ltem 4: Freshfield Street — North side — From a point 3.5 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of St Lule's Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new ltem 5: Hastings Road — West side — From a point 6 metres north of the
northern lcarbline of Franklin Road northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new ltem 6: Howard Road — West side — From a point 6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Islingword Road northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 10.1 Taxi Ranlc At Any Time

Amend ltem | Carden Hill: delete “45.7 metres” and substitute “47.5 metres”,
delete “10.97 metres” and substitute "15.8 metres”

Amend ltem 2 Elm Grove: delete "27.4 metres” and substitute “24.4 metres”
Amend ltem 5 Lewes Road: delete existing description and substitute “From a point
3.1 metres north of the northern kerbline of the access to Brighton & Hove Bus
Garage northwards for a distance of 36.6 metres”

Amend ltem & Lewes Road: delete *10.97 metres” and substitute |1 1.8 metres”

Delete [tem 7: Marine Parade

20



Add new Item 7: Portland Road — North side ~ From a point 27.8 metres west of
the western kerbline of Ingram Crescent East westwards for a distance of 15.5
metres

Amend ltem 10 Stanford Avenue: delete “30 metres” and substitute “29.3 metres”,
delete “Beaconsfield Road” and substitute “Florence Road”, delete *27 metres" and
substitute “40 metres”

Add new ltem |0a: Station Road (Portslade) — West side — From a point 109.5
metres north of the northern kerbline of Franklin Road northwards for a distance of

[4.5 metres

Amend ltem | | Warmdean: delete “VWarmdean" and substitute “YVarmdene
Avenue", delete “18.3 metres” and substitute *17.1 metres”, delete "10.97 metres”

and substitute “12.7 metres”

Amend ftem 12 West Way: delete "35.5 metres” and substitute “34 metres”

12.1 Ambulance Parking Bay At Any Time
Delete ltem [: Down Terrace

Delete ltemn 2: Hartington Road

Schedule | Amendments & Revocations:

The items specified below which were included in the Brighton & Hove (Waiting &
Loading/Unloading Restrictions and Parking Places) Consolidation Order 2008
Amendment Order No.7 2009, under the Part numbers identified, are hereby

amended;

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Renumber new Item [55a “Dover Road - South side — From a point [0.3 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of Lowther Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres
(adjoining No.66 Lowther Road)” as ltem |55b

Renumber new ltem 315 “Hollingdean Terrace — South side — From a point [
metre west of the western kerbline of Roedale Road westwards for a distance of 5.5

metres (outside No.1)" as ltem 315a

Renumber first new tem 56%c “Sandgate Road — North side — From a point 47.5
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Lowther Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5

metres (outside No.3)" as ltem 56%b

Renumber new Item 614 "St Leonards Avenue — West side — From a point 28
metres north of the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance 5.5
metres {outside No.20)" as Item 614a

The items specified below which were included in the Brighton & Hove (Waiting &
Loading/Unloading Restrictions and Parking Places) Consolidation Order 2008
Amendment Order No.3 2010, under the Part numbers identified, are hereby

amended:

21



Part I.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Renumber new ltem 2900 “Vine Cross Road - South side — From the eastern
kerbline of Swanborough Drive eastwards for a distance of 14.5 metres” as ltem
29002

Part 6.1 Disabled Parking Bay At Any Time

Renumber new ltem 58¢ “Bromley Road — North side — From a point |5.9 metres
east of the eastern kerbline of the access road to garages eastwards for a distance of
5.5 metres (outside Maple House)" as ltem 58d

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON )
& HOVE CITY COUNCIL. was affixed hereto this )
28" day of October Two Thousand and Ten )

in the presence of

Elnner .

Authorised Officer

22



